
Deadline for nominations is October 17, 2022

Canadian Institute of Mining, Metallurgy and Petroleum 

Newfoundland and Labrador Branch, Award Nominations
P.O. Box 29106, St. John’s, NL, Canada A1A 5B5 

Paul McNeill

Len Mandville 

T (709) 730-5100 pmcneill@signalgold.com

T (709) 765 3695    lmandville@cim.org

Awards Nomination Form 

Name: _________________________   Company: __________________________ 

Address: ___________________________________   Phone: (___)_____________ 

Fax: (___)_______________                  E-mail: ____________________________

Awards 
 Developer/Miner  Prospector/Explorer 

   Service Provider Geoscientist 

 Areas in which You Have Skills You Wish to Offer 

Reason(s) why this nominee deserves the award 

Nominee Information 

Nominator Information 

Name: _________________________   Company: ________________________________________ 

Address: ________________________   Phone: (___)_______   E-mail: ______________________ 

Please attach additional comments or other relevant material. 

Name: _________________________   Company: __________________________ 

Address: ________________________   Phone: (___)_______   E-mail: ______________________ 

Nominee(s) has agreed to accept the nomination. 

mailto:lenmandville@gmail.com
pmcneill
Underline
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CIM NL Branch Annual Awards 

 Developer/Miner of the Year Award 

The Award is presented to a company, team or an individual that has 
made significant progress in advancing a mine or mine expansion toward 
production; or for a significant contribution to health and safety, 
environmental stewardship or commitment to community; or for 
innovation in the Newfoundland and Labrador mining industry.   

The Award will be presented for recent achievements.  Nominations will 
be valid for two years.   

Prospector/Explorer of the Year Award 

The Award is presented to a prospector, exploration team, or 
company that has made a recent and significant mineral discovery; or
significantly enhanced a prospect or deposit; or identified a previously 
unrecognized prospective geological environment in Newfoundland and 
Labrador.  This is not a lifetime achievment award and all nominations 
should reflect activities within the recent past. The Award will be
presented for recent achievements.  Nominations will be valid for two 
years. 
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CIM NL Branch Annual Awards 

 

The Award is presented to a service provider or team that, through 
development and innovation of the services it provides, has significantly 
contributed to more efficient or effective exploration, or improvements in 
mining operations in the province. 

The Award will be presented for recent achievements.  Nominations will 
be valid for two years.   

The Award is presented to a geoscientist or team whose work in the 
province is in use, and has contributed significantly to either: improved 
regional or detailed exploration models or techniques; a new mineral 
discovery; or a significant expansion to a known ore body in the 
province. 

The Award will be presented for recent achievements.  Nominations will 
be valid for two years. 

Service Provider of the Year Award 

Geoscientist of the Year Award 
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